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Abstract 
This study investigates the impact of financial performance of small and medium-sized enterprises (SMEs) on 
access to finance in Libya. The study is based on the primary data of 557 survey questionnaires on SMEs in 
various sectors of different regions of Libya. The data analysis contains the computation of descriptive statistics, 
correlation statistics and multivariate regression analysis. Our results confirm that financial performance 
expressed by liability to assets ratios, profit, return of assets have no significant effects on access to finance in 
Libya. 
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1. Introduction 
Nowadays the small and medium-sized enterprises (SMEs) play a vital role throughout the world. Badulescu 
(2010) notes explained that SMEs are emerging as the economic engines of many economies worldwide. Abor 
and Quartey (2010) argued that SMEs as being of immense socio-economic importance to any country. In 
addition, SMEs are a source of employment for many people across countries. The purpose of this study is to 
examine the financial performances of SMEs on access to finance in a developing country, Libya. The SMEs 
have a fundamental role in stimulating the key macroeconomic indicators. Such macroeconomic indicators 
consist of GDP, exports and rate of employment. Therefore, SMEs are very important to Libyan economy 
because of the fact that the economy of Libya suffers from lack of economic diversification in her activities.  

The performance of small and (SMEs), in comparison with large enterprises (LEs), reveals great differences in 
the growth determinants and the extent to which these facets yield greater performance from internal and 
external business perspectives. An examination into the growth phases of SMEs across the world has indicated 
that small and medium firms face growth challenges because of traditional knowledge that remains within the 
purview of many it is also revealed that there were positive correlations among productiveness and 
entrepreneurial orientation (EO) with business performance (Fairoz et al. 2010). The nature of and the 
profitability of firms has been investigated with sorts of strategies aimed at establishing internal and external 
efficiencies with regard to expanding the capital structure or improving the financial health of SMEs (Caloghirou 
et al. 2004; Deloof 2003).  

According to Pandula (2011a) financial characteristics affect a firm’s ability to get financing. He categorizes the 
financial characteristics into financial statements, firm performance and tangibility. Pandula explains that greater 
sales as well as profits increase a firm’s accessibility to credit. His argument is consistent with The European 
Commission study conducted in 2003 which found that poor business performance was one of the major reasons 
as to why small enterprises did not receive credit. Pandula contends that a firm’s financial performance is a key 
determinant of access to financing as it indicates the firm’s ability to refund the loan (Pandula 2011a) . Also, 
Pandula explains that profits return on asset and turnover of sales are some of the factors that financial 
institutions assess before they give a business loan to any enterprise.  

A review of prior studies imply that SMEs with greater profits , increasing sales turnover ratios (good financial 
performance) face less credit constraints while those with poor financial performance have been found to have 
very limited access to business credit especially from banks (Pandula 2011a). Most studies have not looked at all 
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the main these factors that constitute financial performance. Therefore, the main objective of this study is to 
identify the effects of financial performance measured by liability to assets ratio, profits and return of assets on 
access to financing for SMEs in Libya. The study will examine the extent to which financial institutions use the 
SMEs performance with regard to these parameters to provide them with business credit. Libya has been chosen 
in this just because SMEs in this country suffer from access to finance.  

This study is organized as follows. Section 2 provides literature review. Section 3 explains conceptual model and 
development of hypothesis. Section 4 discuses research methodology which points out the description of 
variables, sample, validity, reliability and collected data. Section 5 provides details of data analysis and discusses 
the results. The final section concludes the papers. 

2. Literature Review 
2.1 Liability to Assets Ratio for SMEs 

The growth of SMEs has stimulated the need to understand the relationship between liability to asset ratio and 
the overall profitability of small firms (Drever et al. 2007). This has been necessitated by the fact that as SMEs 
tend to raise their growth, they grow their asset base with a view of maximizing their returns on investment 
(Nguyen et al. 2007). the Study by (ALShubiri 2011) in the theory of asymmetric information or pecking order 
suggest that SMEs prefer internal financing to external debt equity, thus SMEs with higher profitability will tend 
to use their high-retained earnings as compared to debt equity.  

This study is consistent with a study conducted by Abor, J. and Biekpe (2007) which found significant negative 
relationship between profitability of SMEs and long-term debt measured by the income before tax (IBT) to total 
assets. According to López-Gracia and Sogorb-Mira (2008), SMEs tend to meet their financing needs in the 
following pecking order: firstly, they utilize their available net profits; secondly, short-term financing; thirdly, 
long-term financing; and the least preferred option remains the attraction of new equity investors, which 
represents the maximum intrusion.  

In essence, the pecking order theory postulates that there exists a negative or inverse correlation between 
profitability and leverage of SMEs, because the more profitable a firm gets, the less it requires borrowing or 
external equity (López-Gracia et al. 2008). The study finds a lot of backing from numerous sources that have, in 
their research, established the higher affinity for short-term debt by small firms with less focus on long-term debt 
equity. Although the facts show that this trend is a natural element faced by most SMEs, studies have shown that 
the shift toward short-term equity is due to shareholder-lender conflicts. 

In relation to liquidity, Manos, Murinde and Green (2012) indicate that the cash ratio (liquidity ratio) exhibits a 
firm’s ability to settle its short-term liabilities in real time. Therefore, their study concluded that it is highly likely 
that highly liquefied firms tend to embrace short-term borrowing compared to SMEs with less efficient liquidity 
synergies. Numerous studies contend that leverage and liquidity will display a negative relationship as SMEs 
generate their internal efficiencies to finance their short-term obligations while avoiding interest costs.  

However, it should be noted that, as firms grow their asset portfolios, they generate appetite from the lenders, 
who emphasize the “collaterality” of the financing process. There is a significant relationship between asset 
capacity of firms and long-term debts. In long-term financing, Deloof (2003) asserted that the capital structure of 
firms plays a significant role in establishing lending and borrowing relationships between SME owners and 
financiers. As such, there is a strong positive relationship between the asset structures of SMEs (as measured by 
the proportion of fixed assets to total assets) and long-term debt. 

2.2 Profits for SMEs  

As SMEs strive toward growth, the need for a profitable entity remains a key focus for all enterprises across all 
industries. Studies have indicated that SMEs’ problems occur during the moment of growth and development 
during which the expenditures on asset acquisition and research & development (R&D) increase considerably 
(Deloof 2003). This scenario creates a higher need for external funding, which particularly affects profitability 
because interest paid reduces the net profitability and the surpluses available for distribution as shareholder 
dividends (sánchez et al. 2011).  

Although profitability increases with the growth of SMEs, the increasing need for funds to finance their 
operations impedes their efforts to profit due to the accumulation and consideration of losses before profits 
(Raheman et al. 2007). How can SMEs attempt to grow and maximize their profitability without sacrificing their 
return on investments? Losses occur when the managerial elements have lost control in of expenditures 
(Bamiatzi et al. 2009). Therefore, cost management becomes a critical element that can spur profitability for 
SMEs. When expenditures do increase, studies suggest that SMEs seeking to succeed must stimulate their profit 
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inlets by focusing on the short-term profit alternatives available to them. Many SMEs tend to work hard with a 
view to embrace long-term profitability, but the analysis of SMEs experiencing strategic growth challenges 
proposes the use of short and rigorous strategies to overcome the constraints of creating profit ventures (Deloof 
2003). 

2.3 Return on Assets for SMEs  
The concept of return on assets (ROA) and its influence on the performance of businesses has emerged strongly 
to capture the attention of many stakeholders. Corporate finance deals regarding capital structure decisions, 
working capital, and capital management decisions remain instrumental in establishing strong and plausible 
firms. Studies show that, although the elements of working capital are crucial in establishing the extent to which 
businesses achieve their profitability, it continues to receive less attention in the mainstream business world 
(Major 2008). 

In examining the essence of return on assets, one should endeavour to consider the specific components that 
converge to realize the overall working capital structure of a business. The study by (ALShubiri 2011) has 
attempted to suggest that over-reliance on current liabilities while holding low or inadequate current assets may 
cause a firm to incur shortages. To establish a plausible working capital structure, an organization has the 
responsibility of implementing succinct measures aimed at building a strong foundation for a formidable 
working capital (Rivaud-Danset et al. 2001). According to numerous studies, many financial institutions have 
over-emphasized the need for a sound ROA for SMEs in order to generate impetus for lending (Mac An Bhaird 
et al. 2010).An analysis into the nature of SME financing across the world suggests that financing for SMEs by 
banks and other financial institutions have relied solely on the extent to which SMEs concretize their 
management in realizing strong financial returns on their overall investments. Perhaps, it may be observed that 
since asset values remain critical items on loan obligations, banks have developed strategies to discriminate 
against SMEs that seem to exhibit low or poor ROA. The issue of ROA is a double-ended blade that cuts on all 
sides of the investment group-the banks and the SMEs themselves. 

Firms that concentrate their performance in building a strong current asset portfolio run the risk of negative 
profitability whereas firms with low current assets tend to have difficulty in maintaining smooth operations due 
to their inability to sustain their daily liquid demands (Shah 2010).The need to create and sustain an efficient 
working capital remains an arguable step toward ensuring the profitability of SMEs. This reason has made banks 
revolve around the idea of ROA and the extent to which SMEs turn them around to generate synergies in their 
business operations (Rivaud-Danset et al. 2001) .One of the questions that may spur the debate could be, “has the 
reliance on ROA blurred the extent to which financial institutions can create other synergies for better 
performance or does the return on assets exclusively explain why SMEs have the energy to demonstrate ability 
to repay their long-term debt obligations”? According to Nazir and Afza (2009), although the managerial facets 
such as marketing, operational efficiencies, and manufacturing have spurred the growth of traditional SMEs, 
working capital and its consequential returns have had enormous effects on small and medium-sized businesses 
and their survival. In his study, ALShubiri (2011) proposed that the act of better management of working capital 
by SMEs remains significant in turning these enterprises into financially healthy business in all respects (Wang 
et al. 2010).  

The ability of a firm to efficiently translate its asset base into a tangible benefit of a financial nature speaks 
volumes in stimulating investors and financiers to structure their investment and lending decisions (Aquino 
2010).In a study on how SMEs responded to the dynamics of the economic environment within which they 
operated shows that the overall generation of SMEs was a function of, current ratio, current assets to total assets 
ratio, and the inventory to total assets ratio. Additionally, these facets unanimously worked as a measure of 
properly functioning working capital. Converse to the expectations of the study, it was found that there existed a 
relatively small correlation between the dynamics of economic environment and changes in the constituents of 
working capital (Leitner et al. 2010). 

3. Conceptual Model and Hypotheses (H)  
Pandula (2011b) explains that firm performance has a great influence on access to credit. Research implies that 
greater profits as well as sales are associated with greater access to financing (Pandula 2011b). Firms with 
increasing sales and sales turnover have less constraint on credit, while poor performing firms have been found 
to have limited access to financing, particularly by banks. Access to finance is required to fill up financial gap of 
the firms. The following conceptual model indicates the presence of financial gap. The financial gap is still a 
source of concern and difficulty faced by SMEs.This study tests the relationship between financial performances 
and access to finance for SMEs by four variables. Therefore, the financial performance measured by liability to 
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assets ratio, profit and returns of asset may have impact on access to finance. Based on the conceptual 
framework and literature described above, a hypothesis is developed as follows:  
 

 

Figure 1. Conceptual model 
 
H: A higher level of financial performance has a positive impact on SMEs’ access to financing and vice versa.  

The following model was employed to examine the validity of this hypothesis:  

ATF =α+β 1 LAR+β 2  PRO +β 3ROA+ ε                          (1) 

Where ATF= access to finance, LAR= liability to assets ratio, PRO= Profit 

LAR, PRO, ROA were employed to measure financial performance and their impact on ATF.  

4. Research Methodology 
4.1 Description of Variables  
4.1.1 Access to Finance 
Access to finance for small and medium enterprises in Libya can be described as the proximity of such SMEs to 
sources of funding such as loans from banks, funding from venture capitalists, equity capital, other forms of debt 
financing, equity finance, debt finance, banking finance, family finance, Islamic finance, Musharaka financing, 
grants and guarantees among others (Beck et al. 2005).  

4.1.2 Financial Performance 

Financial performance of SMEs in Libya can be described as how well the SMEs utilize the resources availed to 
them to generate profits, revenues and fuel their growth in terms of assets and value. In addition, SMEs in Libya 
perform much better than the large corporations due to their proximity to local resources and capabilities, as well 
as the low operational costs associated with such firms (Beck et al. 2006). Such performance is vital in the quest 
by SMEs to source funding. The performance of the SMEs can be measured in terms of debt management which 
is the level of debt used to finance the firm’s total assets measured using the liability to asset ratio profitability 
which is the ability of the firm’s revenue to exceed their expenditure and it will be measured by the return on 
assets and the amount of profits generated by the SMEs; and, finally, the SMEs growth rate which shall be 
measured by the amount of revenues generated by the SMEs per year (Beck et al. 2008). 

4.1.3 Liability to Assets Ratio 

Liability to assets ratio for SMEs in Libya is used to determine the level of debt that is used to finance firms’ 
total assets and it is a measure of the SMEs’ proportion of debt in their capital structure. This ratio is used to 
determine how well the SMEs utilize leverage to finance their operations which, in effect, determines their credit 
worthiness a factor that is highly useful in the process of accessing finance, especially debt finance (Beck et al. 
2008)  

4.1.4 Profit  

Profit generated by SMEs in Libya can be described as the excess of the SMEs’ revenues over their expenditure. 
Presence of profits indicates that the SMEs are sound and profitable and as such they are attractive to providers 
of capital because they can have confidence that they will obtain a return on their investment (Vos et al. 2007). 
This indicates that the SMEs’ access to finance will be enhanced if they are profitable or, in contrast, it will be 
difficult for them access funds if they are unprofitable. The profits can be measured in various ways and includes 
the gross profit, operating profit and net profit. Gross profit refers to the difference between the revenues 
generated by the SMEs and the cost of sales. Operating profit is calculated by subtracting operating costs from 
the gross profit and net profit is calculated by subtracting operating costs, as well as all other cost and taxes from 
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the gross profit (Froeb et al. 2009; Vos et al. 2007). 
4.1.5 Return of Asset 
The return on assets (ROA) ratio is a business profitability ratio that evaluates the efficiency with which profits 
are being derived from the assets of a business.  Basically, the financial ratios measure the quantity of profits 
earned from each shilling worth of the business’s assets. It evaluates the capacity of the business to create profits 
prior to leverage through using business assets. The ROA basically compares the average total of assets with net 
income. The return on assets ratio avoids using leverage arising from owner’s equity and from other debt 
obligations. 

4.2 Sample 

In selecting participants, a random sampling method is used. The method is involved choosing sample units such 
that each population unit has an equal and independent chance of being selected and included in the sample. The 
target population is the 180,000 SMEs listed by the Libya Ministry of Economy and Trade. The sample in this 
research includes Libyan SMEs in various sectors such as, service sector and manufacturing sector, Selection of 
SMEs were based on size of employment ranging from 10-200 (see table 1). The sample comprises 600 SMEs 
many researchers have established that this is optimal size for quantitative surveys (Perry 1995).  
 
Table 1. Classification of SMEs in Libya 

                     Size of employment                                                             Classification project 

                 1-9 employees / works                                                           Micro small business 

                     10 – 49 employees /works                                                       Small business 

50-200 employees /works                                                       Medium business 

                     201- 250 employees /works                                                      Large business 

Source: Prepared by the researchers. 

 
4.3 Data  
The data for this study were collected from the managers or owners of small and medium-sized firms in Libya 
via questionnaire. The researcher chose to focus on the country’s larger industrial cities such as Tripoli, Benghazi, 
Misurata, Sabha, Koms, Zawya and Zwara because the majority of small and medium enterprises are located in 
these areas. The survey questionnaires were distributed through personal visits and by mail. The researcher 
provided instructions on how to complete the questionnaires were and discussed who in each business should 
respond to the questionnaires. Altogether, 600 questionnaires were distributed to SMEs in Libyan industries such 
as services and training, health services, industrial design, agricultural products, and tourism. A total of 557 
responses were collected from SMEs in various regions in Libya. 

5. Data Analysis and Discussion  
5.1 Validity and Reliability Evaluation of Financial Performance of the SMEs 

The validity and reliability are very significant to establish of the business research. The validity and reliability 
of the research findings should be ensured through the adoption of randomised procedures while selecting 
participants in a number of SMEs (Carmines et al. 1979). Subjectivity and favouritism should be avoided at all 
costs. The results should, thus, be a true representation of the targeted population. Validity and reliability should 
also be ensured by conducting tests and retests to confirm that similar results are obtained. 

Table 2 shows the reliability evaluation of financial performance for the SMEs. Cronbach’s alpha tests 
inter-items consistency and the variables of financial performance for SMEs. Therefore, the Cronbach’s alpha 
reflects how well items are positively associated with elements in combination with each other in the 
questionnaire relate to financial performance. Reliability statistics of Cronbach’s alpha is 0.7 and is interpreted as 
acceptable according to (Calaguas et al. 2011). Moreover, the analysis items (Table 2) illustrate that the 
Cronbach’s alpha is interpreted as 0.7 and deemed acceptable for liability to assets (LAR) and profit (PRO). The 
Cronbach’s alpha for return of asset (ROA) is 0.8 The study by Islam et al ( 2011) supports reliability statistics 
related to this analysis. 
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Table 2. The validity results of each item of the questionnaire 

Number of item Item-total correlation Cronbach’s Alpha (If an item deleted) 

LAR 0.74 0.792 

PRO  0.738 0.789 

ROA  0.685 0.808 

Note: Liability to assets= LAR, Profit =PRO, Return of asset = ROA. 

 
5.2 Financial Performance and Access to Finance by SMEs 
In this analysis, the research explores some of the critical elements that continue to pose great challenges in 
developing and growing SMEs. Quite often, these elements, which usually appear to be constraints, begin to 
relate inversely during a small firm’s course of growth. The research considers liability to asset ratio of SMEs, 
along with their return on assets, profitability. The analysis of the literature focused on the determination of the 
existence and the extent of the causal relationship between SME growth patterns and the listed factors as the key 
players in the establishment of sustainable development of small and medium-sized enterprises. The following 
section details analysis of the relationship between financial performance and access to finance by using 
descriptive statistics and correlation statistics for independent and dependent variables. 

5.3 Descriptive Statistics of Financial Performance and Access to Finance 
Table 3 illustrates the descriptive statistics for financial performance and access to finance. Table 3 shows that 
the mean of variables ranges from a maximum of (38.75) to a minimum of (1). It also shows most of the 
variables have similar maximums and the minimum ranges between 1 and 2.  
 
Table 3. Descriptive statistics of financial performance and access to finance 

Descriptive Statistics 

 N Minimum Maximum Mean Std. Deviation 

ATF 557 15 38.75 28.2724 4.23 

LAR 557 1 5 3.026 0.717 

PRO 557 2 5 3.481 0.627 

ROA 557 1 5 3.373 0.694 

Valid N (listwise) 557     

Notes: Access to finance = ATF, Liability to assets= LAR, Profit =PRO, Return of asset = ROA.  

 

The dependent variable (access to finance) records the maximum mean (28.2724), whereas the highest mean of 
the independent variables is profit of SMEs (PRO) (3.481). In contrast, the lowest mean in this table is liability 
to assets (LAR) at (3.026). In contrast, the PRO of SMEs is observed to have the lowest volatility with standard 
deviation (0.627).  

5.4 Correlation Coefficients of Financial Performance and Access to Finance  

The descriptive statistics and correlation coefficients reiterate the measurement of the strength of the liner 
relationship between variables of this model. This means the range of correlation coefficient analysis is (+1) to 
(-1). The correlation coefficients of the financial performance (ATF, LAR, PRO, and ROA) and access to finance 
(ATF) have been organised and reported in Table 4. 

Table 4 shows that there is weak correlation between financial performance (LAR, PRO, ROA and REV) and 
ATF. Therefore, this will reflect on the ability of the model to test these elements. In addition, most of the 
independent variables are positively correlated with each other. More specifically, profit (PRO) has higher 
correlation with liability to assets (LAR) with a value (0.362, P-value < 0.01). Moreover, return of asset (ROA) 
has a higher positive correlation with LAR (0.221, P-value < 0.01) and lower negative correlation with POR with 
value (-0.950, P-value < 0.05). REV represents the final factor in this analysis.  
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Table 4. Correlation coefficients of financial performance and access to finance 

Correlation statistics of financial performance and access to finance 

  ATF LAR PRO ROA  

ATF Pearson Correlation 1     

Sig. (2-tailed)      

N 557     

LAR Pearson Correlation -0.016 1    

Sig. (2-tailed) 0.698     

N 557 557    

PRO Pearson Correlation -0.005 0.362** 1   

Sig. (2-tailed) 0.905 0.000    

N 557 557 557   

ROA Pearson Correlation 0.014 0.221** -0.95* 1  

Sig. (2-tailed) 0.74 0.000 0.025   

N 557 557 557 557  

Notes: **Correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed); * Correlation is significant at the 0.05 level (1-tailed). Access to finance = ATF, 

Liability to assets= LAR, Profit =PRO, Return of asset = ROA 

 

5.5 The Result  

To verify this hypothesis and to check if the independent variables (financial performance) have a positive effect 
on financing of SMEs, this study used ANOVA to clarify and examine the relationship between dependent 
(access to finance) and independent (financial performance) variables as shown in Table 5.  
 
Table 5. ANOVA analysis of the equation related to hypothesis  

ANOVAa   

Model Sum of Squares df Mean Square     F         R2            Adjust R2           Durbin-W Sig 

 Regression 16.705 4 4.176 0.231    0.572        0.498              1.701 0.921

Residual 9960.765 552 18.045   

Total 9977.47 556    

a. Dependent Variable: ATF. b. Predictors: (Constant), LAR , PRO , ROA. ATF= Access to finance, LAR= Liability to assets PRO= Profit, 

ROA= Return of asset. 

 
From Table 5 it can be seen that there is no relationship between access to finance and financial performance. 
This implies that, the hypothesis is not supported at least in the situation of Libya because this factor is 
statistically significantly very weak (0.921, P-value > 0.05). To verify the weak relationship between access to 
finance and financial performance, this study analyses the variables of financial performance (liability to assets 
(LAR), profit (PRO) return of asset (ROA) and access to finance (see Table 6). 
 
Table 6. Coefficients of the equation related to hypothesis  

Coefficients 

Model Unstandardized Coefficients Standardized Coefficients t Sig 

B Std. Error Beta 

 Constant 28.497 1.486  19.183 0.000 

LAR -0.139 0.28 -0.024 -0.495 0.620 

PRO 0.108 0.329 0.016 0.328 0.743 

ROA 0.119 0.271 0.02 0.44 0.660 

a. Dependent Variable: ATF 

Notes: a. Dependent Variable: ATF. Access to finance = ATF, Liability to assets= LAR, Profit= PRO, Return of asset ROA. 

 

Table 5 and 6 provides a description of the influence of financial performance (liability to assets, profit and 
return of asset) on access to finance. The results indicate that there is no significant relationship between access 
to finance and financial performance. In addition, the R2 is 0.572 and this explains the changes that happen to the 
dependent variable with the average of 8% of P-value of the regression. This is due to the existence of three 
independent variables which are liability to assets, profit, and return on asset; while the other 92% refers to other 
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interior factors or simply to coincidence. Therefore, the hypothesis of the study is not supported because the 
relationship between access to finance and financial performance is insignificant.The findings of this study 
indicate that there is negative relationship between the liability to assets and access to finance with coefficient 
(-0.139), but this coefficient is insignificant with the access to finance. In contrast, the profit (PRO) and return of 
asset (ROA) should have positive correlated with access to finance. This argues has been confirmed in the Table 
6 higher PRO and ROA Leads to increase access to finance. The reason behind this finding is that the negative 
sign of liability to assets indicating that the shareholder of SMEs equity is low in Libya SMEs. On the other 
hand, the insignificant positive sign of PRO and ROA indicates that the management of SMEs is not being 
managed well. 

6. Conclusions  

We have attempted to investigate the impact of financial performance for SMEs on access to finance in Libya. 
We have pointed out the variables from theoretical and conceptual points are considered as the measures of 
financial performance and explored their impact on access to finance in Libyan SMEs. This research has found 
no significant influence of financial performance on access to finance in Libyan’s SMEs. This is surprising result 
contrary to the many studies in the existing literature. This may be due to the fact that some other factors such as, 
socio- demographic and political factors are playing a vital role in accessing to financing of SMEs in Libya. The 
further research should be directed to explore these issues.  
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